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Honorary Societies Elect
Phi Beta Kappa Chooses Forty-one and Sigma Xi Seventy-two

FORTY-ONE persons were named to
membership in Phi Beta Kappa, na-
tional honorary scholastic society,

by the Cornell section at the annual spring
election meeting held on Wednesday, May
Ί.. They include one faculty member, Pro-
fessor Alexander M. Drummond, five
graduate students, twenty-two seniors,
and thirteen juniors.

It was pointed out by the committee
that there' were a great many students
whose scholastic averages were suffici-
ently high to warrant election to mem-
bership in the Society, but that they had
not completed enough work in the
humanities to make them eligible for
membership.

Alpha chapter of Sigma Xi, honorary
research society, elected six to associate
membership, three of whom are graduate
students, and three seniors. Three faculty
members, one alumnus, and sixty-two
graduate students were elected to mem-
bership in the organization.

Phi Beta Kappa elections were as
follows:

Faculty:
Prof. A. M. Drummond.

Graduate Students:
Miss Mary Elizabeth Burton, Louis-

ville, Ky.; Sister Mary Gable, St. Joseph,
Minn.; Miss Zaidee Green, Ann Arbor,
Mich.; E. B. Hoitt, Nashua, N. H.; F. W.
Weitzmann, Niagara Falls, N. Y.

Seniors:

F. E. Boiler, Elizabeth, N. J.; J. W.
Branch, Rochester; Miss Eloise Conner,
Stratford, Conn.; P. F. Dorris, Buffalo;
Miss H. A. Ellenwood, Ithaca; Miss M.
L. Eppich, Gloversville; C. A. Fraleigh,
Poughkeepsie; Lester Friedman, Yonkers;
Jacob L Goldbas, Utica; M. D. Gross,
Cleveland; R. Guglielmino, Rochester;
Miss JessicaW. Hale, Salt Lake City, Utah;
Miss F. G. Hesselbach, Ridgewood;
Solomon Kaplan, Brooklyn; S. L. Klein-
berg, Brooklyn; Norman Lampert, Brook-
lyn; Miss M. F. Lindsey, West New-
ton, Pa.; Miss E. L. Marsh, Port
Jervis; Miss Cornelia D. Morse, Auburn;
J. C. Overhiser, Montgomery; Miss
Cynthia E. Rice, Astoria; Irving
Sharfstein, New York City.

Juniors:
T. P. Almy, Redding, Conn.; W. C.

Babcock, Hornell; S. H. Bolz, Albany;
Miss Violet J. Brown, Brooklyn; T. R.
Colborn, Rochester; Miss D. M. Fergu-

son, Philadelphia, Pa.; Miss M. R.
Fleiss, Brooklyn; Miss Eleanor Middle-
ton, Long Island City; Miss Sadie Samuel
Brooklyn; B. M. Schwartz, Brooklyn;
L. M. Tannenbaum, Brooklyn; Miss
Gladys Wilensky, Passaic, N. J.; D. S.
Yorkey, Central Square.

Elections to Sigma Xi were :

Faculty:
Prof. S. A. Asdell; Dr. D. F. Smiley;

Prof. H. C. Stephenson.

Alumnus:
Dr. H. S. Moore.

Graduates:
L. M. Black, Vancouver, B. C.; O. D.

Burke, Ithaca; H. N. Campbell, West-
mount, Que.; Miss Jane L. Chidsey,
Easton, Pa.; S. R. Cooper, Washington,

D. C.; Miss Mary F. Crowell, Shorts-
ville, N. Y.; Louis R. Curtis, Salt Lake
City, Utah; L. G. Davy, Ithaca; M. C.
Desai, India; H. Dietrich, Ithaca; P. C.
Eigman, Brooklyn; J. T. Emlen, German-
town, Pa.; R. P. Ferguson, Ithaca; M. J.
Foter, Long Island City; Mrs. M. S.
Gilbert, Ithaca; Miss Ruth E. Gordon,
Lawyersville; R. M. Haff, Ithaca; O. H.
Hammer, Colorado Springs, Colo.; A. L.
Harrison, Fredericton, N. B., Can.; V.
Heiman, Lake Bay, Wash.; R. C. Hills,
New Orleans, La.; S. H. Hutner, Brook-
lyn; J. A. Hyden, Nashville, Tenn.;
T. L. Jacobs, Forest City, la.; S. Kaufman
Passaic, N. J.; P. P. Kellogg, Cortland;
C. A. Lamb, Wooster, O.; R. B. McCor-
mack, Fredericton, N. B., Can.; N. S. R.
Malouf, Egypt; K. V. [Continued'on page 322
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CORNELL-IN-NEW YORK j Photo by L. B. June'20

This picture shows clearly the Cornell Club (center foreground above arrow—the building with the chimney show-
ing plainly) and the Cornell Medical Center in the left background. The shadow is that of the Empire State
Building (from which the photograph was taken), designed by the architectural firm of which R. H. Shreve Ό2 is

a partner. The Chrysler Building, in the center, contains the offices of many Comedians.
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About
Athletics
Rowing
Cornell's varsity and freshman crews

swept to victory over the boats of Syra-
cuse University on Saturday in the first
regatta of the year held on Onondaga
Lake before a crowd of 15,000 spectators.

Getting off to a bad start, the varsity
trailed the Orange by a few feet, when
Williams at No. 6 in the Cornell boat
caught a crab which put Cornell over a
length behind. The crew quickly got
together, however, and with the utmost
calm and coolness settled down to a 34
beat while Syracuse was pulling at 38.

At the half mile, Commodore Fritz
Garber raised the time to 36 and the
Cornell shell crept up until the two crews
were rowing even at the mile mark.
Allen, Syracuse stroke, tried to raise the
stroke when he saw Cornell creeping up,
but his crew was unable to respond and
Cornell reached into the lead.

Garber raised the Cornell stroke to
nearly 40 as the Cornell boat swept past
Syracuse and the varsity skimmed across
the finish line nearly two lengths ahead
of Syracuse. Despite the demoralizing
effect of a crab, Cornell showed superb
power, and clean rowing.

Freshman Race

The freshmen, rowing against a more
experienced aggregation, gave a per-
formance that indicated that they will be
among the best first year crews in the
East this year. They defeated the Syra-
cuse freshmen by a little more than a
length in rather rough water. The races
had been delayed for nearly two hours by
a strong wind which chopped up the
water so much that rowing was im-
possible. When the freshman boats lined
up for the start the lake surface was still
choppy, which made smooth rowing
difficult. After an even start, the Syra-
cuse No. 6 caught a crab, and although
the Syracuse yearlings soon reorganized,
they fell a length behind the Cornell boat.

The Cornell freshman boat, stroked by
Jenkins, answered every spurt of Syra-
cuse, and maintained the lead of a length,
which was stretched out to nearly a
length and a half as the two crews rowed
by the white skiff at the finish.

Junior Varsity Race

The junior varsity boats started exactly
even, but Hooper, in the Cornell shell,
broke an oar, so that throughout the
race he was rowing with nothing but a
stub. Cornell lost ground steadily
throughout the first half of the race, and
were two lengths behind at the halfway
marker. Payne put up the stroke, but al-
though the shell responded strongly,
Cornell was unable to make up the large
lead held by Syracuse, and the boat
finished a length and a quarter behind.
Had Hopper not broken his oar, the

Cornell boat would undoubtedly have
finished the race in much better shape,
and with a much smaller margin of
victory. The Orange boat, however,
completely outclassed Cornell from start
to finish.

With the first regatta past, Cornell
oarsmen will start at once to train for the
Carnegie Cup regatta on May 19 with
Yale and Princeton on Carnegie Lake,
Princeton. During the week before the
Syracuse races, Coach James Wray put his
charges through several strenuous work-
outs, and favored by good weather, had
his men in tip-top shape.

There was trouble in the freshman boat
during that week, largely centered around
the middle of the boat. Clark Wray,
freshman coach, spent most of his time
training Rogers at No. 4, who had
trouble with his slide and back. This
difficulty was apparently ironed out in
time for the race against Syracuse.

The boatings:
Varsity, Cornell: Garber stroke, Mac-

Leod 7, Williams 6, Schroeder 5, Hopper
4, Borland 3, Foote z, Kitchen bow, Jen-
kins, coxswain. Syracuse: Allen stroke,
Wiloughby 7, Gramlich 6, Schroeberlin 5,
Swanson 4, Matasavage 3, Hildebrand z,
Puls bow, Havill coxswain.

Junior Varsity, Cornell: Payne stroke,
Dickerson 7, Thompson 6, Hooper 5,
Hart 5, VanArsdale 3, Allen z, Vaughan
bow, Tracy coxswain. Syracuse: Ahearn
stroke, Davis 7, Van Arnam 6, Roder 5,
Crowley 4, Greiner 3, Conan z, Jackson
bow, Kirk wood coxswain.

Freshmen, Cornell: Jenkins stroke,
Sowerwine 7, Drisler 6, Kuck 5, Rogers 4,
Hartman 3, Menges z, Snook bow,
Steiner coxswain. Syracuse: Voegeler
stroke, Jacobs 7, Richards 6, Dluski 5,
Seal 4, Blocker 3, Boettger z, Collins bow,
Jones coxswain.

Penn Relay Trophies
Trophies won by the Cornell trackmen

at the Pennsylvania Relay Carnival have
been placed on exhibition in the lobby of
Willard Straight Hall.

The Kappa Sigma Challenge Cup was
won by the 440-yard sprint relay team of

COACH WRAY

Dick Hardy, Bob Kane, Bob Scallan and
Bob Linders. This trophy, which was
won last year by Pennsylvania, will be-
come the permanent possession of the
college or university winning it three
times.

The Josiah H. Penniman Challenge Cup
was won by the half-mile relay team of
Bob Linders, Jack Messersmith, Bob
Scallan, and Bob Kane. This cup also
must be won three times to become the
permanent possession of any college or
university. It was donated by the Pro-
vost of the University of Pennsylvania. It
has been once won by Army and twice by
Ohio State.

The shuttle relay team, who set a new
record for that event this year, brought
home the Phi Epsilon Pi Cup. On this
trophy the following institutions have
legs at present:—

Penn State; Cambridge University;
Ohio State z; Army; Yale z; and Pennsyl-
vania.

In addition to the cups, each winning
team was presented with a large bronze
placque. These are permanent possessions
and will stand in the Schoellkopf Trophy
Room.

Each member of the winning teams re-
ceived a handsome wrist watch, bearing
an inscription of the Pennsylvania Relays.
Captain Dick Hardy received a gold
medal for his second place in the 100-
meter dash event. Since several of the men
were on two winning relay teams, they
received two watches.

Baseball
Harvard—First Game

Cornell divided a double header with
Harvard on Friday in Cambridge, 3-z,
and z-4, at the beginning of the wind-up
of that period designated by Coach Paul
Eckley as the toughest part of the season
for Cornell. Following a double header
the week before, Cornell faced Harvard
twice on Friday and journeyed overnight
to Philadelphia to meet Pennsylvania.
Of these five games played within a
week, Coach Eckley said Cornell would
do well to win four. He was right. Cor-
nell, however, did not rise to the oc-
casion quite as well as hoped, and after
dividing the double-header last week
with Princeton, won only one of the
three games this week end.

Captain Toots Pasto showed some
astounding stamina for a pitcher when
he stayed in the box throughout the en-
tire fourteen innings of the afternoon. He
allowed thirteen hits during the day, but
considering his performance, this does
not speak too badly for him.

Cornell scored a run in the third frame,
and two in the fifth which sufficed to win
the first game. Harvard's two runs came
in the fourth. Miscall, Cornell short-
stop, scored two runs, out of two times
at bat. The third Cornell run was scored
by Johnston. [Continued on page 323
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Pulitzer Prize Winner
Sidney Kingsley '28 Receives the 1933 Drama Award ίor His

Broadway Success, "Men in White11

SIDNEY KINGSLEY '2.8, who will be
remembered by Cornell playgoers as

the man who'' stopped the show'' during
a production of The Merry Wives of Wind-
sor, is this year's Pulitzer Prize winner in
the dramatic section—for his play Men in
White. Kingsley is quick to attribute his
success in part to Professor Drummond
and the early training he received in
dramatics at Cornell.

According to those who know him
well in the present days of his success,
Kingsley is that strange and almost in-
credible rarity, a New Yorker at heart
and a New Yorker by actual birth. Man-
hattan saw his origin and Manhattan
now holds his allegiance after the in-
evitable stretch of charing imprisonment
in the deceptively open stretches of sunny
California. He is devoted to the sun, but
he never got around to seeing any of it in
Hollywood. In New York it shines only
between the rifts in adjoining sky-
scrapers, but at least he now enjoys the
freedom to profit by these slight solar
invasions.

Kingsley became a feature of the
metropolitan scene a little over twenty-
seven years ago. Life was not easy for the
family, but the boy was so apt and eager a
pupil that continue at school he must. As
early as high school he manifested his
attraction to the theatre by writing a
one-act play, designing the scenery,
painting it, and even occupying himself
with the costumes. He acted, too. But his
interests in the theatre were equal; no one
phase of it engrossed him any more than
any other; he merely knew that he was
intensely drawn to it and that that was
where he would eventually work.

At Cornell, which he attended on a
free tuition scholarship, Kingsley took
every available course on the drama,
studying for the most part with Professor
A. M, Drummond. Here, again, he wrote
a one-act play which was not only pro-
duced but won a prize and was later
published in a collection of prize plays of
the university.

But his only really concentrated ac-
tivity was acting; this he did with great
intensiveness, extending it even to the
debating platform, where he won every
possible prize for public speaking.

When he graduated, in 19x8, he
promptly enlisted in a stock company in
Westchester at the then impressive re-
muneration of twelve dollars a week and
worked for four months doing small bits.
He might have continued doing this in-
definitely if the company had not sud-
denly closed and he found himself
without prospects or money. This
turned out to be a fortunate impetus,

though it was very far from appearing so
at the time.

For, with forced leisure on his hands,
Sidney Kingsley was driven to make the
first serious examination of his essential
interests that he had ever made—and
learned, not without surprise, that writ-
ing excited him infinitely more than
acting ever could. He accordingly pro-
ceeded to write a play. It was a farce to
end all farces, by his own description, and
it interested a producer sufficiently to
result in a purchase of the option.

While he was waiting for the produc-
tion which never came (and he is now
pleased that it didn't), he secured a small
role in "Subway Express." He stayed for
several months, still naively convinced
that the purchase of an option on a play
automatically meant its production.
When "Subway Express" closed and
Kingsley's farce was still a lifeless
manuscript, he went into dark retire-
ment, sworn never to act again.

Now came the dark days. First he did
play-reading for a living and then he
wrote short stories for theatre programs.
Then, slowly and methodically, he began
work on what is now Men in White.
This is a play that took three months to
write and three years to rewrite, which is
often the way with dramas that seem to
have emerged out of the nowhere like
precocious mushrooms. Kingsley con-
sulted student friends and general libraries
and the library of the Academy of Medi-
cine.

When the script was ready and put into
circulation, one producer promptly
bought it and promised early production.
But funds failed him. Another producer
bought it. He seemed earnest; he wanted

SIDNEY KINGSLEY

to think about the play for a time. Mean-
while, Kingsley had contracted to go to
Hollywood to write scenarios. He had
spent four unhappy months there when
he received a wire to come back and aid
in the production. But when he arrived he
was encountered with further difficulties
that seemed insuperable.

Now the understandably impatient
author decided to take away the manu-
script and find someone who was really
interested in giving the drama an early
presentation. And he found the Group
Theatre and Sidney Harmon and James R.
Ullman. All of them spent the summer at
Warrens burg, New York, with the
permanent acting company of the Group
Theatre, trying out many versions of a
single scene until the one they wanted
emerged—and the play opened at the
Broadhurst Theatre on the evening of
September 2.6, 1933, three full years after
the play had been begun.

Sidney Kingsley has no intention of
rushing into the composition of a dozen
new plays all at once. A new theme is
now being entertained and, as soon as it
has thoroughly crystallized, he will be-
gin his slow and methodical labors.

PENNSYLVANIA MEET
Cornell and Pennsylvania will meet

Saturday, May 12., on the track at
Schoellkopf Field, in one of the oldest
annual events on the Cornell campus, one
which has been held every year since the
early '90*8.

Although since the War Penn and Cor-
nell have not been the track leaders of the
East as consistently as previous to that
struggle, the meet has lost none of its
color nor of its strong rivalry.

With the exceptional performances
turned in by the Cornell trackmen at the
Pennsylvania Relay Carnival held re-
cently at Franklin Field, and the show-
ing made by Pennsylvania runners in that
and other meets this spring, the meet
promises to be an exciting one, packed
with thrills and close finishes.

Cornell should have little trouble in
the sprints, and in the running events.
Penn's best chances will be in the field
events, although rumors on the campus
this week indicate that Cornell's weight
tossers, jumpers, and vaulters have been
improving and are out to surprise the
Pennsylvanians.

Hopes for the shattering of a few of the
records for this meet, many of which
have been set during recent years run high
at the present, but Saturday will tell
whether or not they are well grounded.

•
FRANCHOT (PAMP) TONE '2.7, is the

favorite movie star of little Joanne
Xenos, nine year old child prodigy, who
appeared recently before a group of child
training experts. Daughter of a jobless
cook, Joanne sailed through grade
schools in less than three years.
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BUILDINGS
and Grounds
Plans for the annual spring cleaning

and repairing of the Cornell campus after
the ravages of winter and fall call for
several major construction operations, as
well as the innumerable little repair jobs,
and cleaning and painting jobs that are
yearly affairs, according to Conant van
Blarcom Ό8, superintendent of buildings

.and grounds for the University.
The old Cornell house, at the corner of

Stewart and South avenues is to be re-
decorated within and without. This
building has for the past several years
been used as a dormitory for students of
the College of Architecture.

A fifty foot extension is to be erected on
the west wing of the Agricultural Engi-
neering edifice on Judd Falls road, back of
the Dairy and Animal Husbandry build-
ings . This will give more ample quarters to
the Agricultural Engineering department.

At Balch Halls, the new women's
dormitories, the ceilings in the bed-rooms
and corridors on the top floor are to be
insulated more thoroughly, against win-
ter cold and summer heat.

Suites of rooms in Baker Tower and
Founders Hall are to be cut up into
single rooms, to make them more readily
rentable.

The basement of the Entomology
Building on the upper campus is to be re-
modeled. This building was formerly the
home of the Home Economics College,
until that school moved into its new
quarters. The basement, where the
cafeteria used to be, is to be reappor-
tioned and divided, to provide for labora-
tory space, and professorial offices.

In general, the trees are being pruned
and trimmed over the entire campus, and
all of them have been tagged and num-
bered, and fed. Each elm is being peri-
odically observed for traces of the Dutch
Elm disease.

Grading and planting of the fore-court
of the new Home Economics Building
has been begun, now that the drainage
problem of that part of the campus has
been solved.

During the summer numerous land-
scaping and planting projects will be
carried on, roads will be resurfaced over
the entire campus, and new colprovia
walks will be built on the campus in
place of the few cinder paths that remain.
Around the new houses of the Sigma Phi
and Psi Upsilon fraternities, the grounds
will be planted and landscaped, and top
soil laid on. Extensive work will be done
on the tennis courts throughout the cam-
pus to put them in good condition.

Buildings will be redecorated and
painted, and will have new weather-
stripping installed. Lavatories and black-
boards will be reconditioned throughout
the entire campus.

The new road behind Willard Straight
Hall that is to run through the site of the

old University Club house, will not be
completed this year, since the fill, which
already contains ιz,ooo yards of earth,
needs about 2.,500 more, which must then
be allowed to settle for a sufficiently long
period to insure solidity. This additional
fill will be added this summer.

In the old armory, the gymnasium floor
will be repaired, and the building will be
redecorated.

BOOK REVIEW

WILLIAM MEYERS, JR., Think Nothing of
It, Galleon Press. $2_.oo.
Meyers, writing in a light, humorous

vein, has produced a small volume of
short stories, which have been described
as "concerning the activities of divers
warm blooded gentlemen and unreluctant
ladies, wandering husbands and wayward
wives."

The book is far from being what that
description implies. While it treats in
general of men and women and their love
affairs, it never approaches the pornogra-
phic in any single word or phrase, and
never reaches that point even by implica-
tion.

Whether or not Meyers is the authority
on women that he seems, it is impossible
to say, but he writes with the utmost con-
fidence.

His dialogue is natural, and rather
convincing, but the humor which the
book contains suffers something by his
short sharp, and often incompleted
sentences. That is to say, he writes in the
most modern style, which, until you ac-
custom yourself to it, may make reading
less pleasant.

Meyers is at present living at 2.13 Front
Street, Harrisburg, Pa. He is a member of
the class of '2.2.. P.

•

HENRY MORGENTHAU, JR., '13, recently
appointed Secretary of the Treasury, ac-
cording to Drew Pearson and Robert
Allen, authors of The Washington Merry-
Go-R.oundy is now in the midst of his
"biggest fight—over income taxes."
According to an article in the New York
Mirror by these authors, Morgenthau
'' found his department organized so that
it seemed to function chiefly for the bene-
fit of the rich. . . . Furthermore Morgen-
thau found that every wealthy man's tax
return was filed with the same examiner
every year, so that it was relatively easy
for the horde of Washington's income tax
lawyers to cultivate that examiner. That
horde of lawyers is giving Morgenthau
the hardest fight he has had. ... He has
been an excellent organizer. He insists on
having men around him he can trust, and
without exception they swear by him."

•

JOHN R. MURLIN Ί6 M.D. has been
awarded a research grant from the
American Philosophical Society "for
investigations into effects of high fre-
quency currents on energy metabolism."

CORNELL ORCHESTRA

Presents Concert

Cornell University's very admirable
orchestra, made up largely of student
talent, and augmented by a number of
towns-people musicians, performed nicely
on Tuesday, May i, under the capable
guidance of George L. Coleman '95 in
presenting a well chosen program which
included Max Bruch's Violin Concerto in
G minor. Professor Gilbert Ross, of the
Department of Music, was the star per-
former and guest artist for this work.

Needless to say, the University Or-
chestra is not a perfect organization. But
when one thinks for a moment the trials
and tribulations which are exclusively
those of a university orchestra conductor
one wonders just how George Coleman
was able to develop the orchestra to the
point to which he has.

Tschaikowsky's Fifth Symphony made
up the first half of the program and was
performed exceptionally well, if not
brilliantly. If in certain parts the first
violin section seemed to be dragging
behind the rest of the players, and if the
French horn players seemed to be having
a little difficulty with their extremely
intricate part, that was to be expected.
Probably the audience as a whole was sur-
prised at the fact that the faults of the
orchestra as a whole were so notably
absent. Outstanding in the presentation
of this work were the second and fourth
movements.

Following the intermission, the strong
sections of the orchestra presented
Haydn's Serenade in fine style. And then
came the most impressive and most
moving part of the program, Bruch's
Concerto. Credit for this goes, not alone
to Professor Ross, and to Mr. Coleman,
but to the orchestra members as well.
It was as if each one were playing his
very best, in order that the chief artist
might not be thrown off. Such a per-
formance by an amateur organization is
exceptional.

It is, and always will be, a matter of
great wonder, that anyone can take a
group of undergraduates, and mould from
them an orchestra such as Cornell boasts,
especially when one realizes the in-
numerable conflicts of rehearsals with
dates, meetings, basketball games, and
dances, which turn a director's hair white
and make a concert such as this an al-
most superhuman feat. Nowhere near
enough praise can be heaped upon the
modest head of George Coleman, for
what he has been able to do with the
Orchestra. Nor can enough thanks be
bestowed, on his behalf as well as on be-
half of the University community, to
those towns-people who form the
steadier back-bone of the group and
make it possible to hold together the
less interested undergraduates.
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COSMOPOLITAN DEBT
An effort is under way to pay off the

debt of $11,000 which the International
Association of Ithaca, Inc., inherited
when it took over cosmopolitan affairs
on the Cornell campus, through a mem-
bership drive.

Seven thousand dollars of this debt is in
the form of a mortgage on the Cosmo-
politan Club building, which is to be
amortized at the rate of four hundred
dollars each year. The remaining $4,000
consist of bills owed largely to local firms
which have been allowed to accumulate
over a long period. These will, of neces-
sity, be paid as soon as possible.

It was the purpose of the new associa-
tion to bring the Cosmopolitan Club back
on a sound financial basis and to pay off
its back bills which student treasurers
had allowed to mount and accumulate. It
is the Association's hope that with a
responsible group of citizens in charge of
the business management of the Club, it
can eventually be made self-supporting,
with a great increase of interest among
students, both foreign and American.

The Association is not seeking mem-
bers for itself, but for the Cosmopolitan
Club. In this way, it is felt that more
interest will be aroused in that organiza-
tion, in participation as well as financial
support.

The Cosmopolitan Club has pledged
75 % of its income from new memberships
toward paying off old indebtedness, and
15% to the furtherance of their program.
Therefore, as soon as the debts are wiped
out, a much larger program of activity
and usefulness will be possible.

Recently the International Association
published the International News of Ithaca
which contained recent news of Cosmo-
politan Club and International Associa-
tion affairs. This has been sent to all
former members of the Club.

LARGE BEQUEST
A bequest of $2.50,000 to Cornell Uni-

versity is included in the will of C.
Sidney Shepard, capitalist of New York
and New Haven, N. Y.

Cornell shares in the estate along with
Yale University, the Northfield, Mass.,
School, churches, church organizations
and relatives.

Although Mr. Shepard was not a
Cornell graduate he served as a member
of the University's board of trustees for
32. years. He was elected trustee in March,
1896, and served continuously to January,
19x8. Mr. Shepard was also a former mem-
ber of the Cornell University Medical
College Council. [See also under Obituaries.]

•

AT THE ANNUAL DINNER of the Cornell

Law Quarterly's editorial board the prin-
cipal speakers were Judge Frederick E.
Crane of the Court of Appeals and Mr.
Jerome Frank Ό6 chief counsel to the
Agricultural Adjustment Administration.

Appointments and Promotions

'"pHE Board of Trustees at the spring
-I- meeting here last Saturday adopted

the budget for 1934-35 for the endowed
colleges without further reduction of
salaries of the University staff.

New appointments, announced at that
time, were made to the teaching staff,
promotions ratified and leaves of absence
approved for the endowed and state
colleges.

Dr. William I. Myers '14, professor of
farm finance and agricultural economics,
had his leave of absence extended to June
30, 1935, enabling him to continue as
governor of the Farm Credit Administra-
tion.

Dr. Kurt Lewin of Berlin, German
child psychologist here this year as acting
professor of education on funds from the
Rockefeller Foundation and the Emer-
gency Committee in Aid of Displaced
German Scholars, was reappointed for
another year and will be assigned a seat in
the University faculty and in the faculties
of the Graduate School, Arts and Sci-
ences and Home Economics.

New English Professor

The appointment of William Clyde De
Vane* as professor of English was an-
nounced, his duties to begin July i. Born
in Savannah, Ga., June 17, 1898, he was
graduated from Yale in 1910 with honors
and took his doctorate there in 19x8, his
dissertation winning the John Addison
Porter prize as the best of the year. He
began teaching at Yale in 192.2. and was
promoted to assistant professor in 192.5.
In 192.5 he married Miss Mabel Phillips of
Westfield, N. J. They have three children,
the eldest of whom is 7.

Principal promotion in the College of
Home Economics was that of Mrs. Ruby
Green Smith '14 Ph.D., who is State
leader of home demonstration agents.
While continuing in that capacity, she
also becomes extension professor.

Other promotions were as follows:

College of Arts and Sciences

R. Clifton Gibbs Ό6, professor of
physics, to be chairman of the depart-
ment 1934-35-

*Editor's Note: As soon as an adequate biog-
raphy and picture of Professor De Vane can be
obtained, the ALUMNI NEWS will print them.

Eugene D.^Montillon Ίi, to be profes-
sor of landscape architecture.

Law School

Lewis W. Morse
librarian.

to be associate

College of Agriculture

Frank L. Fairbanks Ίo, to be professor
of agricultural engineering and agricul-
tural engineer.

Maurice C. Bond '2.6, to be extension
assistant professor of marketing.

Roy G. Wiggans '15, to be professor of
plant breeding and plant breeder.

Allan C. Fraser '13, to be professor of
plant breeding and geneticist.

C. M. McCay, to be professor of animal
husbandry and animal nutritionist.

Benjamin D. Wilson Ί8 Ph.D., to be
professor of soil technology and soil
chemist.

Frank B. Howe Ί6, to be assistant pro-
fessor of soil technology and soil sur-
veyor.

John P. Willman, to be assistant profes-
sor in animal husbandry and assistant
animal husbandman.

Floyd A. Harper '2.7 Grad., to be as-
sistant professor of marketing.

Lowell C. Cunningham '30 Grad., to
be extension assistant professor in farm
management.

Thomas E. LaMont 'z8, to be assistant
professor of farm management and in-
vestigator.

Forrest B. Wright '2.^ to be assistant
professor in agricultural engineering.

College of Home Economics

Lorna Barber, to be extension assistant
professor.

Mrs. Martha Eddy, to be assistant pro-
fessor and assistant State leader.

Katherίne Reeves, to be assistant pro-
fessor.

Mrs. Alma Scidmore, to be assistant
professor.

Veterinary College

Grant S. Hopkins '89, retiring at the
end of the term, to be professor of
veterinary anatomy and anatomical me-
thods, emeritus.

Earl Sunderville Ό8, to be professor of
veterinary anatomy and anatomical me-
thods.

G. S. Hopkins W. I. Myers R. C. Gibbs
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PROFESSORS
Visit Clubs
Three well-known professors, Bristow

Adams, Charles L. Durham '99, and
Rίverda H. Jordan, have returned from
around the circuit, meeting with alumni,
conferring with principals and head-
masters of secondary schools, speaking at
school assemblies, and conferring with
students interested in entering Cornell.
Professors Adams and Jordan were on
trips of two weeks duration; Professor
Durham was out for three weeks. They
visited 2.6 cities.

Professor Adams' itinerary took him to
Milwaukee, Chicago, Grand Rapids,
Jackson, Detroit, Toledo, Cleveland.
Foster M. Coffin '12., alumni representa-
tive, accompanied Professor Adams dur-
ing the first week of his trip, visiting
Milwaukee, Chicago and Grand Rapids.

Professor Durham swung through the
south, stopping at Pittsburgh, Columbus,
Dayton, Indianapolis, Cincinnati, Louis-
ville, Charleston, Norfolk, Washington,
Baltimore, and Wilmington.

The tour of Professor Jordan, out into
the middle west, included St. Louis,
Kansas City, St. Joseph, Omaha, Des
Moines, St. Paul, Minneapolis, and
Davenport.

The annual banquet of the Cornell Club
of Milwaukee was held on April 10. Clair
P. Nourse '2.2. as toastmaster introduced
as speakers Professor Adams and Foster
Coffin. Officers for the new year were
elected: Henry D. Lindsay Ίo president,
succeeding F. Van Epps Mitchell ^3;
Henry M. Stillman '30, vice-president;
Arthur C. Kletzsch, Jr., 'z5, secretary;
Ernst Clarenbach, Jr., '31 was re-elected
treasurer; additional members of the

Board of Governors: Elliott B. Mason
'xo, Mitchell, and Nourse.

The Grand Rapids alumni meeting
was the first Cornell gathering held there
in many years. It was voted to form a
club, with William A. Vawter, xd '05,
chairman, S. Eugene Osgood '04, and
Frank L. DuMond Ίo, appointed as an
organization committee.

DRAMATIC PRIZES

Announcement was made at the last
meeting of the University Faculty of the
winners of the 1934 Forbes Heermans
Dramatic Competition, awarded to under-
graduates for the best one-act plays on an
American theme.

First prize went to Charles B. Moss
'34, for his play This is What Happened.
Second award was given to Avery B.
Cohan '34, for his Dollar Deliriums, Ruth
Beck '34, received honorable mention for
her Frogs Become America.

CAREER CONFERENCE

A novel conference designed to help
college students choose a suitable career
will be held for a three-day session June
i6-2_9 in Newark, N. J.

This " Choosing-a-Career Conference"
will have a "faculty" composed of out-
standing men from many professions.
President Livingston Farrand is on the
advisory board, which includes such men
and women as President Aydelotte of
Swarthmore, President Neilson of Smith,
President Mary E. Woolley of Mt.
Holyoke, President Compton of M.I.T.,
and President Ada M. Comstock of Rad-
cliffe. The speakers will include men from
the fields of advertising, journalism,
shipping, steel, beauty culture, photog-
raphy, radio, social service, the theatre,
and many other professions.

"It is hoped," say the sponsors, "that
the experiment will stimulate young men
and women to think beyond a mere job
and consider the career possibilities five
or ten years hence in the fields they are
entering. If successful, the conference may
become an annual event."

Edward L. Bernays Ίx, public relations
counsel, is named as representative of his
profession at the conference. George
Bijur, member of the administrative
board of L. Bamberger and Co. where the
Conference will have its headquarters, is
general director.

WILLIAM C. WHITE '95, attorney for

the village of Scarsdale, N . Y . has a new

problem on his hands. A bright yellow

lunch wagon, reputed to have cost $8,000,

has been set up in a conspicuous place in

the village, striking a discordant note in

the midst of the village's "quaint English

architecture." The villagers have arisen

in indignation and want Mr. White to do

something about it, which, however, is

apparently outside of his jurisdiction.

'34 MEMORIAL FUND

Addressing a group of nearly one
hundred campaign workers at a dinner in
Willard Straight, Monday April 30,
President Livingston Farrand opened the
drive for the '34 Memorial Fund with a
stirring description of the University, its
purposes and accomplishments in the
past, and the need for financial support
for such institutions.

Dr. Farrand's address followed short
informal talks by Robert E. Treman '09,
and Louis C. Boochever, '12., who told
the financial history of Cornell. The
speakers were introduced by John N.
Brownrigg, Jr., '34, toastmaster and
chairman of the drive.

The purpose of the drive this year is to
obtain a contribution from each and
every member of the class, rather than to
reach any set amount.

HOTEL STUDENTS EMPLOYED

Six students completed their four years
work in the course of Hotel Adminis-
tration in February 1934. The members of
this group and their present addresses
are: D. H. Clements, Childs Restaurant,
1485 Broadway, New York City; Fred-
erick Gray, The Bartram, Philadelphia;
A. Harry Jackson, The Baryram, Phila-
delphia; V. F. Ludewig, 317 Eddy Street,
Ithaca, New York; J. R. Mangan, 41-16
5oth Street, Woodside, Long Island, New
York; H. E. Westfall, 317 Eddy Street,
Ithaca, New York; Ludewig and Westfall
are both acting as assistants to Professors
Meek and Courtney respectively and will
continue in these capacities until June.

IRVING C. BROWER Όi, recently named
city manager of New Rochelle, has had an
interesting career. After graduating from
Cornell, he started as a rodman at Ridley,
Pa., for the old Philadelphia, Baltimore,
and Washington Railroad. "I was with
the PBW in the office of the PAE," he
said.'' We used letters even in those days.''
After serving as division engineer for the
Chicago and Alton some years later,
Brower became city engineer of Evanston,
111. Later he held the same position in
Pontiac, Mich., Lima, O., and Greens-
boro, N. C. Recently he has been head of
the subdivisional Code Authority of
Ohio with headquarters in Cleveland.

•

SEVEN STUDENTS have been named to

the Board of Managers of Willard

Straight Hall as a result of elections for
positions on that body held May i and 2..

They are: Chakratong Tongyai, grad.,

Bangkok, Siam; T. W. Kheel '35, New

York; A. M. Lucha '36, Utica; Paul H.

Reinhardt '35, Oakland, California;

Charles E. Dykes '35, Springfield, Ohio;

Miss Charlotte Putnam '36, Larchmont,

N. Y.; and R. A. Scallan '35, Terrace

Park, Ohio.
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The Week on the Campus

CORNELL may be momentarily leading
the league in baseball, crimson
placards may seek to excite under-

graduate "workers" over May Day.
Sir Arthur Stanley Eddington's lectures
may progress so far into the remotenesses
of interstellar space that even the mathe-
maticians are lost, but what really inter-
ested the students last week was the
news that Paul Whiteman's complete
orchestra will play here for the Navy
Ball on May ^5. The whole outfit will
appear including Paul himself and the
alluring Ramona.

THE PROCEEDS of the Navy Ball furnish
the chief financial prop of the Cornell
band and when students do not flock to
the Navy Ball it's bad news for the band.
But Paul Whiteman will bring them in
from Varna to the Rhine. A good many
conservative investors would be willing
to wager that he will break the all-time
attendance record established by Guy
Lombardo in the consulship of Joe
Beacham.

THE WIND-UP of the underclass dis-
orders incident to the Freshman Banquet
and the Sophomore Smoker sounded like
old times. After the last named event
those who*had borne the brunt called it a
day, went home and washed up. But some
2.00 sophomores who had previously
taken little or no part in the activities
marched down town. They were shunted
up a side street and gradually dispersed
with no damage to person or property.
One student—the wrong one—was ar-
rested and locked up charged with
disorderly conduct, resisting an officer,
etc. In the morning his hearing was
adjourned and and the boy was paroled
in the custody of Professor C. L. Durham
who once again functioned successfully in
the familiar role of Tribune of the Plebes.

You WILL NOT be surprized to learn
that after the incidents recorded in the
preceeding paragraph there appeared
undergraduate letters in the Sun protest-
ing against unnecessary roughness on the
part of the police. When you were a
sophomore you also believed that night
sticks should be wielded con amove in
breaking up harmless student raids
through the business section of Ithaca
and only on the heavily upholstered
portions of the person. Human nature
doesn't change much.

•

THIS DEPARTMENT could (but it won't)
print the names of zo professors now at
Cornell who as sophomores (i) took part
in down-town marches (i) were slapped

a tergo with night sticks and then (3)
wrote indignant letters complaining of
police brutality. As I remember it we
referred to them as "armed Kossacks" in
my time.

•

THE CHI Psis and the Alpha Delta
Phis gave largely attended faculty teas on
Sunday afternoon. The boys do these
things with astonishing skill and in-
creasing facility. The Alpha Delts have
introduced a new gadget. When a pro-
fessor drives up there is a freshman to
relieve him of his Ford and to park the
thing for him. Later the same freshman
seeks the professor out in the crush and
returns his keys.

THE DRIVE for the 1934 Memorial Fund
started on Monday with a dinner to the
drivers in the Terrace Room of Willard
Straight. The captains and troopers were
spurred on by speeches from President
Farrand, R. E. Treman '09 and L. C.
Boochever Ίz. After the first day 8J^ %
of the men and z8% of the women had
subscribed.

•

THIS DEPARTMENT was, it seems, in
error when it announced two weeks ago
the passing of the Sun s department
known for 2.0 years as the Berry Patch
and the establishment, in place thereof, of
a new satirical column to be called Beer
and Skittles. More in sorrow than in
anger has this error been called to our
attention—repeatedly and in print. The
Berry Patch will continue to appear, it
seems, most of the time. The new column
will take its place occasionally—once a
week perhaps. And the new one isn't to
be Beer and Skittles at all. It is Skittles
and Beer. Our apologies.

THE SPRING FOOTBALL campaign was
brought to a conclusion with the practice
of May 4.

ITHACA was not one of those cities
which moved its clocks an hour ahead
when April passed into May. We are
essentially a rural community, which
must regulate its life on the rising of the
sun and the going down of the same—on
the dew upon the clover and the natural
roosting habits of the fowls of the air.
Ithaca is upon standard, time and you'd
better remember that when you come
back for games and things.

•

PERHAPS we bore you with too many
extracts from the agony column of the
Cornell Sun, but to us these advertise-
ments are human documents which paint
the picture of current undergraduate life

upon the campus with a degree of stark
realism to which art can never attain—

"Lost—Tan camel's hair coat, Mc-
Creery label, at Beaux Arts Ball Friday
night. Reward. Phone Meyer 9684.

Lost—New portable typewriter; loser
left without other means of paying ex-
penses; Reward.

Lost—Among other things, pair of
dirty white buckskin shoes in front of
Old Armory Saturday night; purely
sentimental value. Moderate reward.
Call 9579.

THE TRUSTEES met last Saturday—al-
ways an exciting event upon the campus.
From the standpoint of the community
the news of that meeting is both good and
bad. It is good to the extent that aca-
demic salaries will not suffer a further cut
and it is bad to the extent that Professor
Morris Bishop has been granted a sabbatic
leave and will not be with us for the
second term next year. Provided, of
course, that he succeeds in renting his
house.

•

THE DεWiTT HISTORICAL Society,
founded in 1865, but for 30 years last past
moribund, has been revived and is again a
going concern. The society is devoted to
the history of this locality and to the
preservation of documents, memorials
and monuments connected therewith. It
was founded largely at the instigation of
Ezra Cornell and at the time of building
the Cornell Library. The plans for the
new building provided a room for a
Farmers' Club and another for an Histori-
cal Society. Neither existed. Ezra Cornell
wanted both and he got both. The
archives reveal that Francis Miles
Finch did most of the dirty work in
organizing the historical society and was
its first secretary. Judge Finch was at the
time a young lawyer in the community
and not averse to pleasing Mr. Cornell.

•

AMONG THOSE elected to Phi Beta
Kappa on Wednesday was Mr. Jake Gold-
bas. This is news only because Mr.
Goldbas is the University's best boxer and
the same young man who made that first
touchdown against Pennsylvania last
Thanksgiving day. He is to be our boxing
coach next year. In appearance Mr.
Goldbas is not of the conventional Phi
Beta Kappa type. He looks more as if he
had spent his first three years of boxing
lessons in learning how to block left jabs
with his face. For this reason it took the
faculty a long time to find out—and to be
convinced—that his interests are in-
tellectual, that he possesses one of the
best minds on the campus and that he is
an outstanding student. R.B.
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"ELIJAH11 AND THE
New York Orchestra
Cornell music audiences were given

varied treats over the weekend, which
were guaranteed to appeal to any taste,
and which apparently appealed to most.

On Friday evening, under the baton of
Nikolai Sokoloff, the New York Or-
chestra presented the final of the Unίver-
sityjxmcert series, which also ushered in
the spring music festival on the Cornell
campus. The principal number on the
Friday evening program was the favorite
Brahms' Fourth Symphony. This work
was done exquisitely, and with true
artistry as Brahms' Fourth should be
done. The second half of the program
began with Houssorgsky's A Night on
Bald Mountain., and continued with
LiadoίΓs Enchanred Lake and Rimsky-
KorsakofΓs Le Coc[ d'Ot.

Saturday afternoon, Mr. SokolofF con-
ducted his players in what was frankly
announced as a "pop" concert in Bailey
Hall, featuring Schubert's "Unfinished"
symphony No. 8 in B Minor. That this
work still holds audiences spellbound was
clearly evidenced by the behaviour of the
listeners that afternoon. The remainder
of the program consisted of Dvorak's
Overture, Carnaval, which preceded the
Schubert symphony; a Johann Strauss
Waltz, delightfully done; Tschaikowsky'
Andante Cantabilβ string quartet move-
ment, and Sibelius' symphonic poem,
Finlandia. Altogether, a charming pro-
gram, even though as equally "pop."

The musical week was climaxed Satur-
day evening, with the presentation of
Mendelssohn's Oratorio Elijah, in the
Drill Hall, with a chorus of 439 voices, a
choir of Ί.^ voices, five soloists, and the
accompaniment of the New York Or-
chestra.

Professor Paul Weaver directed the
production from beginning to end, with
a true and sincere assuredness

SokolofF, after conducting two con-
certs in as many days, relaxed and sat
back to listen to his orchestra as Pro-
fessor Weaver conducted it. Those of the
audience to whom Elijah was unfamiliar
were obviously agreeably surprised at
the colorful and tuneful rendering.

The audience was held throughout the
performance by the dramatic theme, and
the story of Elijah and his troubles in
coverting and keeping converted the
the people of Israel.

Outstanding was the work of the choir
in the early part of the oratorio when they
sang as priests of Baal crying to their
God to ignite the fire under an offering
as Elijah stands by sneering visibly at
their inability to get results from their
idol.

It seemed to this critic that Miss Doris
Doe, contralto, and Dan Gridley, tenor,
more than held their own with Richard
Bonellί, famed Metropolitan baritone
and Miss Emily Roosevelt, soprano.

Henry Carey, Jr., Ithaca boy soprano,
had a difficult role, which he performed
admirably, although in the vast spaces
of the Drill Hall, his voice at times
sounded strained.

This performance of Elijah is the last
of many well-remembered ones here.
The first time the oratorio was given in
Ithaca, it was under the leadership of
Hollis Dann, in 1903, and by the Festival
Chorus. The accompanists were George
Daland, organist, and the Boston Festival
Orchestra, under direction of Emil
Mollenauer. Mr. and Mrs. Eric Dudley
were soloists and the place was Sage
Chapel.

FOOTE BASKETBALL CAPTAIN

William H. Foote '35, of Milwaukee,
Wise., son of Edward T. Foote Ό6, was
elected captain of the 1934-35 basketball
team at a meeting of the lettermen held
during the past week.

Letters for the 1933-34 season were
awarded to the following men: Foote,
Ernie Downer '36, Poughkeepsie; Charles
E. Dykes '35, Springfield, Ohio; John J.
Ferraro '34, Buffalo; Louis M. Freed '36,
WilkesBarre, Pa.; Nelson D. Houck '34,
Poplar Ridge, N. Y.; A. C. Taylor '34,
Wyomissing Hills, Pa.; John C. Wilson,
Jr., '35, of Milwaukee, son of John C.
Wilson Ό6; and Steve Voelker '34, New
York.

A cup donated by the Buffalo Alumni
Club was awarded to John J. Ferraro as
the team's most valuable man. Nelson
Houck received a cup, donated by Coach
Howard Ortner Ί8, as best defense man.
Steve Voelker received an anonymously
donated cup as the man who had shown
the most improvement.

•
A TUTORIAL PLAN to individualize the

education of superior students of the Col-
lege of Liberal Arts and Sciences at the
University of Illinois has been proposed
and will become effective when it is
officially approved by the University
Senate and the Board of Trustees. The
plan will give juniors and seniors with
high averages during their first two years
an opportunity to pursue a part of their
work under a tutorial adviser rather than
to follow the formal classroom instruc-
tion. Students under this tutorial system
will be given a comprehensive examina-
tion by a faculty committee at the end of
the senior year.—School and Society.

•

A FACULTY BASEBALL LEAGUE Will again

be formed this spring, according to H. H.
Benson '2.9, traffic control executive, who
is making out the schedule. Eight teams
have already signed up for the play, as
compared with ten last year.

•

JACOB S. FASSETT, JR., '36, son of Jay
Fassett Ίz, (Jake, to you) has won the
competition for the position of Manager
of the University Musical Clubs.

HORSE SHOW
The fourteenth annual Cornell Horse

Show will take place Saturday, May 19,
on the Upper Alumni Field, and will be
the most ambitious presentation of its
kind ever undertaken by the R.O.T.C.
here.

In addition to continuing the steeple-
chase, which was the outstanding event
at last year's show, several new events
have been announced, by the committee.
Among these features will be ladies' and
gentlenίen's saddle classes for horses
owned and maintained in Tompkins
County. Fine harness horses will be
shown this year from many famous
stables.

In the gymkhana events there will be a
mounted obstacle race, musical chairs
contest, and mounted wrestling. An
obstacle jumping event will also be
staged.

In all there will be 19 different classes
covering three- and five-gaited saddle
horses, jumpers and hunters, children's
classes, polo ponies, and the climaxing
steeplechase. Since such a large number of
events have been scheduled, the show this
year will start at n a.m.

The committee in charge this year con-
sists of: Major General D. E. Nolan,
honorary chairman; Colonel J. J. Fulmer,
chairman; Major C. S. Ferrin, secretary;
Captain S. E. Bullock, treasurer; Bart J.
Viviano '33, executive committee chair-
man; B. L. Gordon '33, Max Dercum '34,
D. B. Goodwille '34, Don L.. McCaskey
'34, A. J. Nichols '34, C. L. Ranney '34,
A. A. Reed '34, W. A. Rider '34, Starbuck
Smith '34, Dan S. Stevenson '34, A. M.
Unger '34, M. A. Bradley '35, J. W. Cobb
'35, and W. J. Williams '35.

SPRING DAY
Sage Green will be the site of the

Spring Day Circus which is to take place
on May z6, according to information re-
leased recently by the Spring Day Circus
Committee. More than this the commit-
tee will not reveal concerning its plans
for the forthcoming event.

Even the possibilities of another duck
race, perhaps on land, have been sug-
gested by thoughtful undergraduates, as
have ground-hog relays, snail sweep-
stakes, and other similar enterprises.
With the committee keeping mum, any-
thing may happen (and probably will).

UNIVERSITY HELPS ATHLETICS
Acting upon recommendations of the

Policy Committee of the University
Athletic Association, the Board of
Trustees authorized at its spring meeting
last week, a loan in support of the pro-
gram of the Association.

The recent petition of the students was
received by the Board, and referred to
President Livingston Farrand with the
suggestion that he report his recom-
mendations at a subsequent meeting.
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About

The Clubs
Philadelphia

At the annual meeting of the Club the
following officers were elected: president,
C. Rodman Stull '07; vice-president,
James Harper '2_z; treasurer, Samuel F.
Eldredge 'x6; secretary, Charles B. How-
land 'x6; assistant secretary, Stanley Law
'17; directors, Walter W. Buckley '2.6;
Wilson H. Patterson '09; Chandler Burpee
'17; Howard M. Rogers '07; Roy L.
Williams '93; George T. Ashton Ίz;
Charles D. Mackay, Jr., '2.1; Frank L.
O'Brien, Jr., '31.

The Club house at 12.19 Spruce Street is
open for luncheons every day and makes
an ideal place for Cornell men to gather
and settle the affairs of the nation each
day.

Jack Moakley, track coach, was the
luncheon guest last Friday on the ocasion
of the Penn Relay Carnival.

The Club is much encouraged by recent
developments and looks forward to an
improving year.

GERMAN PICTURE SHOWN

" Emil und die Detektive," a German
talking film, was shown at the Cosmo-
politan Club on Thursday evening, as
one of the regular series of foreign movies
being presented by the Club. A large
crowd of students from the German de-
partment swelled the audience to'' crib,''
for they are reading Erich Kastner's
famous story in the classes there this
term. It was condoned cribbing, however,
because some of the professors had seen
the film before and stated that the film
was so amusing and so well done, that
their students really ought to see it, even
if they were reading the story.

CORNELL DAY DANCE

Visiting high school and preparatory
school guests on the Campus for Cornell
Day will be treated to a dance in the Drill
Hall on Saturday evening, following the
other events of the week-end. Students
and faculty members will be charged a
moderate sum for the dance, which is
being run by the Student Council for the
benefit of the International Association of
Ithaca, and the Cosmopolitan Club. John
L. Mott, executive secretary of the As-
sociation, and assistant to the Dean of
the Faculty, is assisting in the arrange-
ments.

•

ALBERT E. PETERMANN Όo, general
counsel of the Calumet and Hecla Con-
solidated Copper Company, has been ap-
pointed one of eleven men to constitute
the Code Authority for the administra-
tion of the Copper Code under the NRA.
Petermann is a resident of Detroit with
offices in the Dime Bank Building, and a
member of the firm of Wiley Streeter,
Smith and Ford.

Tentative Reunion Program
FRIDAY, JUNE 15

Morning: Breakfast. Willard Straight Hall (all morning beginning at 7:15);
Home Economics Cafeteria (7:15-9:15); Sage College and Prudence
Risley Dining Rooms (7:30-9:00).
Registration. Drill Hall, all day.
Class and interclass games.

12 to 2p.m. All classes lunch in Drill Hall. Fifty cents.

2:50 p.m. Baseball game. University of Pennsylvania vs Cornell, Hoy Field.

f : o o p.m. Organ Recital by Professor Harold D. Smith. Sage Chapel.

Dinner: Service at Home Economics Cafeteria (5 .-45-6:45); Willard Straight Hall
(5:45-8:00); Sage College and Prudence Risley (6:00-6:45).

7:00 p.m. Senior and Alumni Singing. Gold win Smith Portico.

8:45 p.m. Performance by the Cornell Dramatic Club. Willard Straight
Theatre.

8:4$ p.m. Musical Clubs Concert.

11:00 p.m. Senior Ball. Willard Straight Hall.

SATURDAY, JUNE 16

Morning: Breakfast. Willard Straight Hall (7:15-11:30); Sage College and
Prudence Risley (7:30-9).
Registration. Drill Hall, all day.

7:30 a.m. Breakfast, all Cornell women. Home Economics Cafeteria.

8 to TO a.m. Civil Engineering Breakfast. All civil engineers and their wives
invited. Sibley Recreation Room (under Sibley Dome).

9:00 a.m. Annual Meetings:
Cornellian Council. Morrill Hall, Room 321.
Cornell Association of Class Secretaries. Willard Straight Hall,

southwest lounge.
Federation of Cornell Women's Clubs. Martha Van Rensselaer Hall,

auditorium.

10:30 a.m. Cornell Alumni Corporation, annual meeting. President's talk to
alumni; announcement of results of Alumni Trustee elections.
Baker Laboratory of Chemistry, auditorium.

12 to 2 p.m. University luncheon for alumni and families, faculty, out-of-town
guests, and seniors. Drill Hall. (No luncheons served Saturday at
Prudence Risley, Sage, Balch, or Willard Straight Hall.) Purchase
tickets at Drill Hall. Sixty cents.

2:30 to 6 p.m. Picnic and supper at Taughannock Falls for all classes from
'96^03 under the auspices of Class of '99. Fifty cents.

6:00 p.m. Class dinners. (Alumni and others who are not attending class
dinners will find the Cafeteria (5 .-45 to 7) and Tea Room (5 .-45-8) in
Willard Straight Hall open for dinner, as well as the Home Eco-
nomics Cafeteria, (5:45 to 6:45).

8:if p.m. Performance by the Cornell Dramatic Club. Willard Straight
Theatre.

9:30 p.m. Rally of all alumni and their guests, under auspices of '19. Bailey
Hall.

SUNDAY, JUNE 17

Morning: Breakfast, Sage and Risley (730-9). No meals served in Sage and Risley
after breakfast. Other meals may be obtained in Balch Hall and
Willard Straight.

4:00 p.m. Baccalaureate Sermon. Bailey Hall.

7:oo p.m. Senior Singing and Class Day exercises. Gold win Smith Portico.

9:00 p.m. Women's Senior Singing. Balch Hall Court.

11:00 a.m.

MONDAY, JUNE 18

Commencement exercises. Schoellkopf Field.

Dormitory Accommodations for AH Returning Alumni
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Honorary Societies Elect
Continued from page 313] Manning, Ithaca;
J. C. Mauer, Scranton, Pa.; A. Miller,
Brooklyn; H. R. Nelson, Homer; T. T.
Odell, Buffalo; W. J. O'Connell, South
Ozone Park, N. Y.; D. K. O'Leary,
Seattle, Wash.; H. S. Osgood, Dravos-
burg, Pa.; C. E. Palm, Rogers, Ark.;
G. K. Parris, Barbadoes, B.W.I.; M. W.
Quimby, Corinna, Me.; J. F. Randolph,
Long Beach, Calif.; H. W. Rankin,
Blackshear, Ga.; W. A. Rawlins, Geneva;
Mrs. V. H. Rheades, Auxvasse, Mo.;
A. T. Ringrose, Prattsburgh, N. Y.;
T. G. Rochow, Maplewood, N. J.; N. A.
Schappelle, Hamburg, N. Y.; G. W.
Simpson, Louisburg, Pa.; S. Singh, India;
M. Solis, Panama City, Pamana; J. A.
Strelzoff, Wilkes Barre, Pa.; Miss Lillian
C. Thomsen, Farmingham, Mo.; Miss
Mildred B. Throw, Macksville, Kans.;
K. L. Turk, Mount Vernon, Mo.; V. M.
Watts, Ithaca; D. F. Weekes, Ithaca; J.
C. Woodward, Lennox ville, Que., Can-
ada; S. H. Work, Ithaca; C. R. Wylie,
Grosse Pointe Park, Mich.; D. Wyman,
Ithaca; R. S. Young, Edmonton, Alberta.
Can.; W. F. Koehler, Albion, Pa.; D. A.
Schofield, Lima, Peru; F. C. Williams,
Mead ville, Pa.;

Class of 1954:

E. C. Crittenden, Washington, D. C.;
L. L. Miller, Rochester; R. D. Myers,
Mercers burg, Pa.

WOMEN'S CORNELL DAY

Fifty-seven young women of sub-fresh-
man age, appeared on the campus Satur-
day morning for a women's Cornell Day,
sponsored as an experiment by the Ithaca
(women) Cornell Club, and the women's
groups of Utica, Syracuse, Cortland, and
Rochester.

The girls arrived at about 10 a. m. and
were assigned to student guides who
showed them over the campus, and took
them to confer with professors. At
luncheon, all visiting girls and their
guides were guests at Balch Halls, and
spent the afternoon driving about, boat-
ing on Beebe Lake, until 4 o'clock when
they met for tea in Wilkrd Straight.

Albert R. Mann '04, provost of the
University addressed the girls there, and
explained the set-up of the various col-
leges at Cornell, and discussed entrance
requirements.

Members of the committee of the Ithaca
Club were Miss Lillian Fasoldt 'zy, presi-
dent of the Cornell Women's Club of
Ithaca and Mrs. R. C. Osborne (Agda
Swenson) 'zo. Miss Mary Donlon '2.0 of
New York was also present to take part
in the program. The student committee,
which arranged for guides for the girls

consisted of Miss Isabel White '34,
president of the W.S.G.A., chairman;
and Norma Nordstrom '35, Ruth Harder
'35, and Helen Smith '36.

EZRA CORNELL
Hotel-for-α-Dαy
Friday saw the opening, and Saturday

the closing, of the famed Ezra Cornell
Hotel-for-a-Day, in Willard Straight
Hall, with more than 360 persons in at-
tendance to make the affair one of the
largest in the history of the Cornell
School of Hotel Administration and of
Willard Straight.

Members of the Board of Directors of
the Cornell Society of Hotelmen, alumni
of the hotel school, met early Friday
morning in preparation for the annual
spring meeting of the Society on Satur-
day. Seniors in the hotel school and guests
met for luncheon in the terrace room of
Willard Straight at noon, and following
the luncheon there was a round-table
discussion of hotel problems, at which
visiting hotelmen aired their views and
presented their problems. Professor
George F. Warren '03, gold-manipulator,
and A. L. Olsen, former member of the
hotel school staff and now with the NRA
in Washington, took part in the confer-
ence on hotel economics.

In the evening came the formal opening
of the Hotel-for-a-day, with a banquet
and dance in the Memorial Hall. David
B. Mulligan, president of the Bowman-
Biltmore hotels, delivered the principal
address. He was introduced by Hubert E.
Westfall '34, managing director of the
annual enterprise. Professor H. B. Meek,
director of the hotel school, spoke
briefly for the school.

The banquet over, the tables were
cleared from the floor, while coffee was
served in the women's lounges, and then
the room was given over to dancing.
Despite several house-party dances on the
hill, the party was well attended, and
extremely successful.

The entire dinner was prepared and
served by students in the hotel school.
Every possible task, but one, was per-
formed by the students during the entire
period when the hotel was open.

The door man was a student, despite
his natty maroon uniform; the desk
clerks were students, even though they
also act as desk clerks for Willard
Straight; the bell boys were students; the
hostess was a student; the chef a student;
and likewise the manager, the assistant
managers, the waiters, the undercooks,
the bus boys, and all the other at-
tendants and servitors.

One job was not filled this year by a
hotel student, however, and that was the
job of page-boy. The twenty-four-year-
old diminutive page-boy (he's exactly
forty-two inches tall) whose voice goes
out over the radio to advertise a smart
cigarette, arrived in Ithaca on Thursday
evening, and remained over the week-end
to handle the paging assignments. His
presence was the signal for students to
start smoking the brand of cigarettes he
advertises, for before the hotel opened he

handed out small packets of them to all
those who were within reach. Because
his height is his fortune, the tiny page
has had himself insured for $100,000
which amount he receives if he grows an
inch within the period of one year. Since
he is already about twenty-four, he's
considered a fairly safe "risk."

DWYER ELECTED

M. H. Dwyer '35 Law, was elected
president of the Cornell Law Association
on Tuesday, at the annual poll for officers
of that body, which is made up of all
students in the Cornell Law School. He
succeeds H. W. Huff cut '34 Law. Other
officers elected were: Raymond Cothran
'36 Law; vice-president; and E. M. Gold-
berg '35 Law, secretary-treasurer. The
new officers will take office in the fall.

PROFESSOR PAUL M. O'LEARY 'z^ Ph.D.,
has been named to the Consumers' Ad-
visory Board of the NRA. He will give
advice and counsel on the making of
codes. O'Leary will remain in Ithaca
most of the spring, and will continue his
teaching duties, but will make short
trips to and from Washington when the
need arises.

MARSHALL LECTURES

Edwin J. Marshall '94 delivered the
annual lecture of the Frank Irvine
Foundation Saturday morning in Myron
Taylor Hall on '' The Process of Drafting
Contracts and Other Legal Papers." He
is senior partner in the firm of Marshall,
Mehorn, Marlar, and Martin. The Irvine
Foundation was established in 19x4 by
the Cornell chapter of Phi Delta Phi,
national legal fraternity. Each year some
outstanding lawyer is invited to Cornell
on this foundation to deliver the lecture
before the entire student body of the
Law School.

•

FOSTER M. COFFIN Ίx, alumni repre-
sentative, and Edgar A. Whiting '2.9,
assistant director of Willard Straight
Hall, were speakers at the dinner of the
Cornell Club of Albany held at the Uni-
versity Club in that city on Thursday
evening, April 19. Motion pictures of the
campus, and of the last Pennsylvania
football game were shown after the
dinner. About fifty Cornellians attended.

•

W. ATLEE BURPEE, JR., '17 has sailed
for Europe to exhibit six plants of the
$10,000 nasturtium which won the high-
est awards at the recent flower shows in
the large Eastern cities. The plants will
be in bloom and on exhibition at the
Chelsea and Convent Garden flower
shows and in Holland, Germany, Bel-
gium, and France. This double hybrid
nasturtium was developed by David
Burpee '17. In order to cheat the seasons
and bring it to its height in record time
he shipped seeds to Buenos Aires, Puerto
Rico, and Australia by air mail.
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Athletics
[Continued from fage )if\

HARVARD (2.)
AB R H PO A E

Ware, c f 3 0 0 1 0 0
*Allen i o o o o o
Adzigian, } b 3 0 1 1 0 0
Nevin, i b 3 1 1 3 1 0
Gleason, I f 1 1 1 4 0 0
Gibbs, r f 3 0 1 0 0 0
Maguire, c 3 o o 10 o o
Fitzpatrick, ib i o o i i o
**Prouty i o o o o o
Woodruff, s s 3 0 1 0 1 0
Loughlin, p 3 0 0 1 1 0

Totals 2.6 3 6 11 4 o
*Batted for Ware in yth inning.
**Batted for Fitzpatrick in yth inning.

(CORNELL (3)
AB R

Miscall, ss
Draney, ib
Dugan, If
Downer, cf
Forehlich, rf
Seranati, 2.b
Mayer, 3b
Johnston, c
Pasto, p

2.

2,

3
3
•L

2.

Ί.

3
3

2.
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O

O

O

O

O

I

o

H
I

I

o
o
o
o
o
I

o

PO
o

II

3
0

0

2.

O

5
0

A
2.

O

0

0

0

2.

4
o
5

E
I

o
0

o
0

o
o
0

o

Totals 2.3 3 3 2.1 13 i
Score by innings:

Cornell ................... o o i o 2. o o — 3
Harvard .................. o o o 2. o o o — 2.

Runs batted in — Miscall i, Draney, Maguire,
Fitzpatrick. Three base hits — Johnston, Wood-
ruff. Home runs — Miscall. Sacrifice — Mayer,
Gleason, Fitzpatrick. Left on bases — Cornell 3
Harvard 5. Base on balls off Loughlin 3. Struck
out by Loughlin 7; by Pasto 3. Passed balls —
Maguire. Balk, Pasto. Umpires — Kelleher and
Keady. Time of game — i hr. 2.1 min.

Second Harvard Game

In the second game, Harvard started
things off with a run in the first, but Cor-
nell retaliated with two in the latter
half of the session. During the next two
frames both teams were scoreless, Har-
vard chalked up another in the fourth,
and two more in the final frame, for an
easy win.

Miscall, again at bat twice, scored
once more for Cornell. Bill Dugan, left-
fielder, scored the other Cornell run.

HARVARD (4)
AB R

Prouty, cf
Adzigian, 3b
Nevin, ib
Gleanson, If
Gibbs, rf
Maguire, c
Hines, zb
Woodruff, ss
Allan, p

4
4
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3
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3
3
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o
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o
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o
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o
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o

Totals Ί.-J 4 7 xi 7 i

CORNELL (2.)
AB R H PO A E

Miscall, ss 2. i i 2. 2. o
Draney, i b 4 0 0 7 0 0
Dugan, I f 3 1 1 1 0 0
Downer, cf 2. o o i o i
Bradley, cf i o o o o o
Froehlich, rf 2. o i o o o
Seranati, zb 2. o o 3 i o
Mayer, 3b 2. o o i 3 o
Johnston, c 2. o o 6 o i
Pasto, p 3 0 0 0 3 0

Score by innings:
Harvard i o o i o o 2.—4
Cornell 2. o o o o o o—2.

Runs batted in—Prouty, Hines, Froehlich z.
Three base hit—Maguire, Stolen base—Prouty,
Adzegian, Miscall, Dugan. Sacrifice hits—
Woodruff, Johnston. Left on bases—Harvard
4, Cornell 7. Base on balls off Pasto i, off Allen
3. Struck out by Pasto 4, by Allan 4. Hit by
pitcher, by Allan (Miscall x, Froehlich); Um-
pires—Keady and Kelleher. Time of game—
i hr. 30 min.

Pennsylvania Game

Cornell dropped to third place in the
Eastern Intercollegiate Baseball League
by virtue of the defeat handed to the
Eckley-coached players on Saturday by
the team of the University of Pennsyl-
vania, 5-1.

Don Kellett, always a problem, was
largely responsible for Cornell's defeat,
as usual, and this time batted a home
run, and helped in two scoring spurts,
which defeated Cornell.

Although Cornell stands in third
place, Pennsylvania and Harvard, who
are tied at first place have each three
wins and two defeats, while Cornell has
four wins and three defeats, so that the
position isn't as bad as it might be. A
split in this week's Harvard-Pennsyl-
vania double header, and a Cornell
victory over Yale will restore the Ithaca
aggregation to its former standing as
league leader.

Cornell's single score came in the fifth
inning, when Mayer walked, and ad-
vanced on two fielding errors, to come
home on Draney's sacrifice to right field.
Penn scored in the first, and the sixth,
while holding Cornell completely blank
during the rest of the game.

Cornell threatened again in the ninth,
after loading the bases on Kellett's error,
a pass, and a fielder's.choice. Barton, the
Pennsylvania pitcher, pulled himself out
of the hole, however, and struck out
Kreimer, pinch hitting for Pross, and
flyed Draney out.

CORNELL (i)
AB R H PO A E

Draney, ib 4 o i 13 i o
Frost, 2 . b 4 0 x 4 4 0
Dugan, I f 4 0 1 1 0 0
Downer, c f 4 0 1 3 0 1
Froehlich, r f 3 0 0 0 0 0
Miscall, s s 4 0 1 1 3 0
Mayer, 3 b 4 1 0 1 1 0
Wallace, c 4 o o i 2. o
Pross, p 2. o o o 4 o
*Kriemer i o o o o o

Total

Baker, rf
O'Donnell, If
Kellett, ss
Kozloff, 3b
Shan'hn, cf
Powel, 2-b
Freeman, ib
Lynch, c
Barton, p

34 6 14 15

PENN (5)
AB R H PO A E
2. O O O I O

3 I I 3 I O

3 ^ 1 0 6 3

3 I O I I O

4 0 1 4 0 0

3 I I 4 3 I

3 0 1 9 0 0

3 O θ 6 θ O

4 o i o 2. o

Totals 2-3 2. 3 .11 9 2.

Total 2.8 5

*Batted for Pross in ninth.

2.7 14 4

Score by innings:
Cornell o o o o i o o o o — i
Pennsylvania 2. o o 003 oo o—5

Runs batted in—Kellett 2., Draney, Powel,
Freeman 2..

Two-base hits—Downer, Barton. Home run
—Kellett. Stolen bases—Kellett, Baker, Powel,
Sacrifice—Draney. Double plays — Kellett,
Powel and Freeman: O'Donnell, Kellett and
Kozloff. Left on bases—Cornell 9, Penn. 7.
Bases on balls—Off Pross 6.

Batting Averages

Bob Frost, Cornell player, is tied for
the league leadership in batting so far
this season, with an average of .500, ac-
cording to figures released recently by the
League.

Nevin, Harvard, and Morgan, Colum-
bia, share honors with Frost. Nevin, at
bat 18 times in 6 games, has 9 hits
credited to him. Frost, in 3 games, was
up 8 times, and made four hits, and
Morgan, in one game hit once in two
times at bat. Nevin's record looks as
though it would be hard to beat, al-
though the season is not yet half over.

Bradley and Kreimer, Cornell men, are
listed among the .333 hitters; Dugan is
hitting .Z92_; Downer and Seranati are in
the .z/3 class; and the others string along
down the list.

Cornell stands in fourth place with a
team batting average of .135 as compared
to Harvard's average of .2.73 at the head
of the list and Dartmouth's average of
.100 at the foot.

In team fielding Cornell's standing and
average are both better, being nearly that
of Columbia, who tops Cornell by four
hundred-thousandths, which is of course
absurd. Here are the figures: Columbia
fielding average—.962.96; Cornell fielding
average—.962.92..

Tennis

Princeton courtmen defeated the Cor-
nell tennis team on Friday on the Ithaca
courts, 8-ι. Steve Hamilton, Cornell's
undefeated singles player, scored the only
victory for Cornell. His win was the
second point scored against Princeton at
tennis this season.

The doubles, between Bacon and Flynn,
of Princeton and Marcis and Sklasky of
Cornell, was the only match in addition
to Hamilton's victory, in which Prince-
ton did not win two straight sets. In this
match, the Cornellians showed spirited
resistance, with the sets going, 6-4, 4-6,
6-4.

Summaries: Singles: Hamilton (C) de-
feated Foulke (P), 4-6, 6-1, 6-3; Flynn (P)
defeated Condon (C) 6-4, 6-2.; Lynch (P)
defeated Sklarsky (C) 6-4, 6-1; Tilney (P)
defeated Tilden (C) 6-0, 7-5; Bacon (P)
defeated Doughty (C) 6-1, 6-1. Doubles:
Tilden and Foulke (P) defeated Anderson
and Condon (C). 6-1, 6-1; Bacon and
Flynn (P) defeated Marcus and Sklarsky
(C) 6-4, 4-6, 6-4; Tilney and Whitman
(P) defeated Tilden and Doughty (C)
6-3, 6-2..
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Obituaries
CHARLES SIDNEY SHEPARD, of New

Haven, Oswego County, N.Y., retired in-
dustrialist and philanthropist, and for
over thirty years a trustee of the Univer-
sity, died April 2.6 in his suite in the
Roosevelt of pneumonia.

Born in Buffalo on July 2.9, 1856, he
was the son of Sidney and Elizabeth De
Angelis Wells Shepard. Mr. Shepard was
graduated from Yale in 1878 and took a
law course at Hamilton College in 1879.

Upon the death of his father, who was
a prominent industrialist and railroad
man, Mr. Shepard succeeded in 1893 to
many positions of trust, and devoted a
great deal of time to the care of the estate.
He gave large amounts to charity and
other worthy objects, but almost in-
variably anonymously.

Mr. Shepard was a director of the
Mobile & Ohio Railroad Company, Sea-
board Air Line Railway Company and
Fort Dodge, Des Moines & Southern
Railroad Company. In 1910 he had re-
signed from many other directorates.

He was admitted to the bar in 1879, but
did not practice the profession. Mr.
Shepard was chairman of the board of the
Republic Metal ware Company. He was a
member of the Metropolitan Museum of
Art; a life member of the American
Museum of Natural History, American
Philological Society, New York State
Historical Association, New England
Historical-Genealogical Society and of
the Buffalo Fine Arts Academy, and a
member of the American Social Science
Association.

Mr. Shepard also was a member of
Delta Kappa Epsilon, Phi Beta Kappa,

and various patriotic educational and
philanthropic societies. He was a Re-
publican and a Presbyterian. His clubs

were the Buffalo, Saturn (Buffalo),

Fortnightly (Oswego), and University,

Lawyers' and Yale (New York).
He never married. He was a cousin of

the late Judge P. C. J. De Angelis '71, of

Utica.

CHARLES DUANE BAKER '73, an attorney
and a former United States Attorney for

the Southern District of New York, died
April 13, at St. Luke's Hospital. He was
88 years old. Born at Painted Post, N. Y.,

Mr. Baker attended Oberlin College and

Cornell. A member of the State Legisla-
ture from ι88i to 1886, Mr. Baker also
had been secretary to the commission
which codified the State laws of civil

evidence. He was considered an authority
on custom-house law and was at one time
a special attorney for the Federal Govern-
ment. Mr. Baker was one of the founders

of the Harlem Republican Club. He was a

member of the Steuben Society and Delta
Upsilon. Surviving are two sons and a
daughter.

WALTER J. FLANIGAN ' 81 A. B., retired
dramatic and music critic of The Newark
Evening News, died of a heart attack in his
sleep during the night at his home in
Bloomfield, N. J. on April 1.5. He was 74
years old. Mr. Flanigan held his post on
The News from Sept. i, 1901, until Sept. 2.
of last year, when he retired on the advice
of physicians. Born in Binghamton, N.
Y., Mr. Flanigan was educated there be-
fore entering Cornell. After graduation he
went to work on The Binghamton Republi-
can in an editorial capacity. After seven
years on that paper he went to The Syra-
cuse Post-Standard as a dramatic critic. He
came to The News from Syracuse. He is
surrived by a sister, Miss Anna Jean
Flanigan.

EDWIN VERNON MORGAN '98 Grad.,
former American Ambassador to Brazil,
died April 15, at his home in Petropolis of
angina pectoris. He was 69 years old.

The body will be returned to the
United States. The embassy has asked
Mr. Morgan's brother for permission to
allow the government to take charge of
the funeral.

Mr. Morgan recently received the order
of the Southern Cross from the Brazilian
Government in recognition of his services
during twenty-one years of diplomatic
service here. The press eulogizes Mr.
Morgan and recalls that recently he said
that he desired to die here. A resident
Vargas has decreed full military honors
for Mr. Morgan.

Mr. Morgan, until his retirement at
the beginning of the Roosevelt adminis-
tration a year ago, had been Ambassador
to Brazil for twenty-one years, a record of
continued service for American diplomats.

Born in Aurora, N. Y., on Feb. x, 1865,
he was the son of Henry A. and Margaret
Bogart Morgan. He was a grandson of the
late Edwin B. Morgan, who represented
the Cayuga district in Congress for many
years, and who was a close friend of
Secretary William H. Seward.

From 1905 to 1910, Mr. Morgan filled

the somewhat troubled post of Minister
to Cuba, from 1910 to 1911 he was Minis-
ter to Uruguay and Paraguay, and the
following year he was appointed Minister

to Portugal.
The following year, 1912., he started his

long period of service in Brazil when he

was appointed Ambassador by President

Taft.

A few years ago he was described by a
prominent Brazilian as "an honorary
Brazilian, owing to his long residence
there and his thorough and sympathetic
knowledge of the entire country."

He had never married. He was an
honorary member of the Institute His-

torico e Geographico Brasileiro of Rio de
Janeiro and a member of the Metropolitan

Club, Washington, and the Century Club,
New York.

Concerning

The Alumni
'89—William Alanson White, M.D.,

superintendent of St. Elizabeth's Hospi-
tal, Washington, has been named Thomas
W. Salmon Memorial Lecturer.

'95 CE—Reginald H. Keays has just
returned to the United States after spend-
ing many years in Greece. His address is
44 Riverside Drive, New York.

'99 LLB—George J. Mersereau on April
i was appointed solicitor for Missouri
and Iowa under the Santa Fe Railroad,
for whom he has been an attorney since
1913. His offices are in the Fidelity Bank
Building Kansas City, Mo. He is a mem-
ber of the Kansas City, Missouri State,
and American Bar Associations.

Όi AB—James C. Otis has moved his
law offices to W-ι86ι First National Bank
Building, St. Paul, Minn.

'07 ME—William P. Gruner has re-
signed as vice-president of the Philip
Gruner Lumber Company, remaining as
director, and has gone with the Mutual
Bank and Trust Company, 715-18 Locust
Street, St. Louis, Mo.

Ό8 ME—Herbert Chase has an article
in The New York Times for April 2/2. on the
"Motor Car on Tracks." Chase says that
"Modern types of rail coaches, self-
propelled by conventional forms of
gasoline or oil engines, are finding wider
and wider use on steam railroad lines
throughout the country. Several hundred
are now in constant service, and automo-
tive as well as railway engineers are find-
ing reasons for further extending their
use." The article is illustrated.

'09 LLB—George A. Mathers has
moved from Tuscon, Arizona, to 1x7
Pleasant Street, Bennington, Vt.

'14 BS—Earl G. Brougham is working
for his Ph.D. in the department of Farm
Management.

Ί6 CE—Luis F. Cianchini is a captain
in the 2.6th Infantry at Plattsburg Bar-
racks, N. Y.

'17 BS—Harold J. Evans is a land bank
appraiser for the Federal Land Bank of
Springfield, Mass. His address is George-
town, N. Y.

'17 BS—Isadore Finkelstein is a prac-
ticing dentist in Ossining, New York. His
home address is 44 William Street,
Ossining.

Ί8 AB—John Hart is secretary of
Hospital Service, Inc., a group hospitali-
zation plan of Charleston, W. Va. The
plan offers hospital protection for in-
dividuals, families, and employed groups
for a nominal yearly sum. It is a non-profit
mutual association.

'19 ME—Jo H. Cable, consulting
petroleum engineer, has moved to 1700
Tilden Street, Wichita Falls, Texas.

'2.0 BArch—John W. Ross, manager of
the apartment department of A. B. Ash-
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Baltimore Trust Building

forth, Inc. of New York, was last week
elected vice-president of the firm.

'xo BS—Edward Davenport 'xo and
Mrs. Davenport announce the birth of a
daughter, Margaret Ann, on January 2.6.
They reside in Accord, N. Y.

'x3 BS—John Vandervort is a member
of the faculty of Penn State College. His
address is 52.8 West Beaver Street, State
College, Pa.

'±5 BS—John L. Schoonmaker and
Mrs. Schoonmaker of Accord, N. Y., an-
nounce the birth of a son, John, Jr., last
September.

'17 AB, '19 LLB; 'x8 AB—Sidney J.
Berger '27 and James S. Landes '2.8 have
announced the formation of a partnership
for the general practice of law under the
firm name of Berger and Landes, with
offices at 70 Pine Street, New York.

'-LJ AB, '2.9 LLB—Mortimer Braus an-
nounces the removal of his law offices to
the Bar Building, 36 W. 44th Street, New
York.

'Ί.J—Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Blaker of
Akron, Ohio announce the marriage of
their daughter, Marion to August B.
Miller, Bowdoin 'z4 on February 10 in
St. Bartholomew's Church, New York.
Mrs. S. Kennard Brookmire (Margaret
Bowlby) '2.5 was matron of honor. G.
Schuyler Tarbell '2.6 was one of the ushers
Mr. and Mrs. Miller are living at 404
East 55th Street, New York. Mrs. Mil-
ler's father and mother are both Cornel-
lians. Mr. Baker was for some years
professor of Physics in the University and
since 1919 has been with the Goodrich
Rubber Company. His residence is 616
Weber Avenue, Akron, O.

'z8—James B. Taylor is now assistant
sales manager with the Highland Iron
and Steel Company, with offices at 400
Madison Street, Chicago.

'31 AB—The engagement has been an-
nounced of Paul A. Bosshard of Glen
Ridge, N. J. to Miss Marion Traber of
Zurich, Switzerland.

'•$2. BS, '-$2. BS—The marriage is an-
nounced of Bertha Abraitys and Clarence
A. Alther. They are living at 150 Vernon
Avenue, Yonkers, N. Y.

'32. BS—Frank Vaughn is teaching
vocational agriculture in the Unadilla
High School, Unadilla, N. Y.

'33—Solomon Aronoff has returned to
the United States from Edinburgh, Scot-
land, and is living at 2.^ Madison Street,
Hoboken,N.J.
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Do you yearn to retire at an early age?—
have you a special hobby you should like
to indulge as early in life as possible?—
have you a desire to travel?—are you a
scientist who longs for time to devote to
extensive research ?

You can do any or all of these
things by providing an in-
come for yourself, to begin
at a designated age.

A Prudential Annuity or
Old Age Endowment

will do it.

Edward D. Duffield, President

Home Office, Newark, New Jersey


